
ITB 210202  

Asphalt Materials - OPR:  Consolidated Road & Bridge 

 

Vendors Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. P Squared Emulsions Plants 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Product 

(A) 

Price per Gallon 

(B) 

Del. Charge per 

Gallon 

   (A + B) 

Total Price per 

Gallon 

(A) 

Price per Gallon 

(B) 

Del. Charge per 

Gallon 

(A + B) 

Total Price per 

Gallon 

CMS-1P No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CMS-1PF $2.50 $0.15 $2.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CHFRS-2P $2.80 $0.15 $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRS-2P $2.80 $0.15 $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRS-2* $2.45 $0.15 $2.60 $2.99 $0.00 $2.99 

CRS-1P 

 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid 

AC10-2TR $2.96 $0.15 $3.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC20-5TR $3.02 $0.15 $3.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC-10 $2.38 $0.15 $2.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC-5 $2.43 $0.15 $2.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CSS-1H TACK OIL** $2.50 $0.15 $2.65 $2.69 $0.00 $2.69 

CSS-1H TACK OIL 1:1*** $1.40 $0.15 $1.55 $1.37 $0.00 $1.37 

AC-10 XP $3.00 $0.15 $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC-20XP $2.90 $0.15 $3.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC 15P $3.11 $0.15 $3.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

MC-30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AE-P**** $2.75 $0.15 $2.90 $2.04 No Bid $2.04 
AE-P50/50 $1.53 $0.15 $1.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute***** No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.82 $0.00 $2.82 

CSS 1P Diluted 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

PASS CR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions: Alternates:  
CMS-2P $2.90/$0.15/$3.05 

 

P Squared Emulsions Plant:  Alternates: 

*CRS-2 alternate CWE-2, $2.99/$0.00/$2.99 

**CSS-1H Tack Oil alternate P2S1, $2.69/$0.00/$2.69 



Bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 gallons. 

Common Carrier bills demurrage at $90.00 per hour, after second 

hour.  

Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff.  

Pump and hose charge is $90.00 per load.  

For equipment ordered not used, carrier may charge up to $400.00. 

A Federal Environmental Fee will be added to bid prices at a rate of 

$0.49770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or $0.00150/gallon for 

emulsion loads. 

***CSS-1H Tack Oil 1:1 alternate P2S1, $2.69/$0.00/$2.69 

****AE-P alternate Prime Concentrate, $2.04/$0.00/$2.04 

*****FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute alternate ROC, $2.82/$0.00/$2.82 

 

Demurrage at $80.00 per hour, after second hour.  

Pump charge is $80.00. 

Push charge is $80.00 per hour. 

Smaller quantities Available, subject to freight differential of $0.25/gal 

less than 5,000 gal. 

Return loads subject to charge from delivering freight lines. 

Delivery over 250 miles subject to additional charges. 

 

 Awarded in Commissioner’s Court on Monday, March 8, 2021 as a multi award to Ergon Asphalt & P Squared Emulsions, Inc., for 

the following items: CMS-1PF , CHFRS-2P , CRS-2P , CRS-2* , AC10-2TR , AC20-5TR , AC-10 , AC-5 , CSS-1H TACK OIL** , CSS-1H TACK 

OIL 1:1*** , AC-10 XP , AC-20XP , AC 15P , AE-P**** , AE-P50/50 , FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute***** 


