
ITB 210201  

Aggregate Road Materials 
 

 

Bidder 
Item 1 

Grade 3 

Item 2 

Grade 3 Delivered 

Item 3 

Grade 4 

Item 4 

Grade 4 Delivered 

Item 5 

Grade 5 

Item 6 

Grade 5 Delivered 

Item 7 

Grade 4 
PB 

Item 8 

Grade 4 PB 
Delivered 

 
cost 

per ton 
cost per 

ton 
cost 

per mile 
cost per ton 

cost per 
ton 

cost per 
mile 

cost 
per ton 

cost 
per ton 

cost per 
mile 

cost 
per ton 

cost 
per ton 

cost per 
mile 

Green Dream 
International 

 
$ 73.50 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$73.50 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$73.50 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$73.50 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

MUDco Ready-
Mix LLC 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
$13.20 

 
$ 20.20 

 
$ 5.00* 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

Vulcan 
Construction 

Materials 
$29.00 $35.03 See Alternate $29.00 $ 35.03 See Alternate $ 31.00 $ 37.03 See Alternate $ 65.00 $ 71.03 See Alternate 

West Texas Paving No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 75.00 $0 .25 $0 .25 

 

Bidder 
Item 9 

Screenings: Ty 1 
Item 10 

Screenings: Ty 2 
Item 11 

Embed Material: Ty 1 
Item 12 

Embed Material: Ty 2 
Item 13 

Flex Base Grade 2 

 per ton per ton per ton per ton per ton 

Green Dream 
International 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 

 
See Alternate 

 
$ 29.19 

MUDco Ready-
Mix LLC 

$16.50  No Bid See Alternate See Alternate See Alternate 

Vulcan 
Construction 
Materials 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

West Texas 
Paving 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11.25 

 

Professional Road Maintenance bid was rejected due to pit location.  

 

Awarded in Commissioner’s Court on March 22, 2021 as a Multi - Award to : MUDco Ready-Mix LLC for Item 5, Item 6 and Item 9 ; Vulcan Construction 

Materials for Item 1 , Item 2 , Item 3, Item 4, Item 7, Item 8; and West Texas Paving for Item 13. 
 

 

 



 

Bidder Alternate Item Alternate Item Cost 

Green Dream International 

Commercial Base Baker $20.67/ton 

Screenings CCM $12.72/ton 

57 Damron $33.66/ton 

Grade 8 Damron $24.65/ton 

57 Marble $36.36/ton 

FlexBase Grade 2 $29.47/ton 

MUDco Ready-Mix LLC 

*Add $5.00/mile past the included 45 miles from 
RE Janes Slaton Quarry 

 
 
 
 

1962 Grade 4 – Item 3,4 Alternate $17.33 Not Delivered / $24.33 Delivered* 

Grade 7 – Item 3,4 Alternate $19.75 Not Delivered / $26.75 Delivered* 

1” Embedment Ty1 – Item 11 Alternate $20.90 Not Delivered / $27.90 Delivered* 

1/2” Base Aggregate – Item 12 Alternate $19.80 Not Delivered / $26.80 Delivered* 

1-3/4” Base Aggregate – Item 1, 2, 13 Alternate $18.10 Not Delivered / $25.10 Delivered* 

Screenings: TY 1 $23.50 Delivered* 

Vulcan Construction Materials 

LLC 

0-10 - Miles $3.93 

10-15 - Miles  $4.77 

15-20 - Miles  $5.54 

20-25 - Miles $6.42 

25-30 - Miles  $7.56 

30+ - Miles $0.20/per mile 

West Texas Paving #7 Grade 4-PB (UNCRUSHED GRAVEL) $ 45.00 

 


