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Aggregate Road Materials 
OPR: Consolidated Road & Bridge 

Bid Summary 
 

Vendor 
Item 1 

Grade 3 
Item 2 

Grade 3  
Delivered 

      Item 3 
 Grade 4 

Item 4 
Grade 4  

Delivered 

Item 5 
Grade 5 

Item 6 
Grade 5  

Delivered 

Item 7 
Grade 4 

PB 

Item 8 
Grade 4  

PB Delivered 

    cost 
 per ton 

cost 
 per ton 

cost  
per mile 

        cost 
   per ton 

 cost  
      per ton 

cost 
per mile 

 

cost 
per ton 

cost 
per ton 

cost 
 per mile 

 

cost 
 per ton 

cost 
per ton 

cost  
per mile 

 

Bedrock Crushing LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Green Dream 
International LLC $14.85 $23.10  $0.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.15 $25.85 $0.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

R.E. Janes Gravel Co. No Bid No Bid     No Bid           See  
    Alternate   No Bid 

 

No Bid 
 

$13.25 No Bid No Bid   No Bid    No Bid No Bid 

Vulcan Construction 
Materials LLC $40.00 $46.03 See  

Attached       $40.00 $46.03 
 

See  
Attached $33.00 $39.03 See  

Attached $68.00 $74.03 See  
Attached 

 

Vendor 
Item 9 

Screenings: Ty 1 
Item 10 

Screenings: Ty 2 
Item 11 

Embed Material: Ty 1 
Item 12 

  Embed Material: Ty 2 
Item 13 

Flex Base Grade 2 

 per ton per ton per ton per ton     per ton 

Bedrock Crushing LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.50 

Green Dream 
International LLC No Bid $6.60 No Bid $27.50 $14.85 

R.E. Janes Gravel Co. $16.00 No Bid See Alternate See Alternate See Alternate 

Vulcan Construction 
Materials LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 



 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Multi-Award: Green Dream International LLC for Item 1, Item 2, Item 5, Item 6 Item 10, Item 12 and Item 13;  
R.E. Janes Gravel Co. for Item 3, Item 5, Item 9, Item 11, Item 12 and Item 13;  

and Vulcan Construction Materials LLC for Item 1, Item 2, Item 3, Item 4, Item 5, Item 6, Item 7 and Item 8. 
 

Bidder Alternate Item Alternate Item Cost 

R.E. Janes Gravel Co. 

1962 Grade 4 $16.50 

Grade 7 $18.50 

1” Embedment (Ty 1 Embedment)  $21.00 

½” Base Aggregate (Ty 2 Embedment) $19.00 

1 ¾”  Base Aggregate (Flex Base Item 247 Grade 3) $17.00 

Vulcan Construction Materials 
LLC 

0-10 - Miles $3.93 
10-15 - Miles  $4.77 
15-20 - Miles  $5.54 
20-25 - Miles $6.42 
25-30 - Miles  $7.56 
30+ - Miles $0.20/per mile 
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