
 
 
 

ITB 210704 
 Crushed Caliche 

Consolidated Road & Bridge 
Bid Summary 

 
 
  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Multi-Award: C&D Waste Ltd., Ronnie Zahn Paving, Inc. and West Infrastructure Construction, LLC for items 1 & 2. 
No award for item 3. 

Vendor Source/Pit Location 
Date 

Available  

Item #1 
 

(County 
load/ County 

trucks) 
 

Item #2 
 

(Vendor 
load County 

trucks) 

Item #3 
 

(Price per 
cubic yard 
Delivery) 

 

Item #3 
 

(Price per 
mile 

Delivery) 
 

C&D Waste Ltd. 
C&D Waste Facility  

7702 N. Ave  
Lubbock, TX 79403 

8/4/2021 
Two week 

notification  
$10.00/ton $11.50/ton N/A N/A 

Green Dream 
International LLC 

PB Materials – Tahoka 
1361 FM 1328,  

Tahoka, TX 79373 
2 Days ARO  $18.43 $18.43 $29.35 $0.26 

Ronnie Zahn 
Paving, Inc. 

Zahn Pit  
FM 41 & CR 2330  
Lubbock County 

Now  $12.00 $12.50 No Bid  No Bid 

West 
Infrastructure 

Construction, LLC 

Carroll Pit  
CR 260  

Brownfield, TX 79316 

15 Days 
Notice $10.50/ton $11.25/ton No Bid $0.28 

West Pit  
3408 CR 1200  

Lubbock, TX 79407 

15 Days 
Notice $12.00/ton $12.50/ton No Bid $0.27 

East Pit 
7630 E. CR 7220  
Slaton, TX 79364 

15 Days 
Notice $9.25/ton $9.75/ton No Bid $0.27 


