
ITB 190905  

Asphalt Materials - OPR:  Public Works 

 

Vendors Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. P Squared Emulsions Plants 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Product 

(A) 
Price per Gallon 

(B) 

Del. Charge 

per Gallon 

(A + B) 

Total Price 

per Gallon 

(A) 
Price per Gallon 

(B) 

Del. Charge 

per Gallon 

(A + B) 

Total Price 

per Gallon 

CMS-1P* $2.50 $0.48 $2.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CHFRS-2P $2.80 $0.15 $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRS-2P $2.80 $0.15 $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRS-2 $2.45 $0.15 $2.60 $2.99 $0.00 $2.99 

CRS-1P 

 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.45 $0.00 $1.45 

AC10-2TR $2.96 $0.15 $3.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC20-5TR $3.02 $0.15 $3.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC-10 $2.38 $0.15 $2.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC-5 $2.43 $0.15 $2.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CSS-1H TACK OIL $2.50 $0.15 $2.65 $2.69 $0.00 $2.69 

CSS-1H TACK OIL 1:1 $1.40 $0.15 $1.55 $2.69 $0.00 $2.69 

AC-10 XP $3.00 $0.15 $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

AC 15P $3.11 $0.15 $3.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

MC-30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.82 $0.00 $2.82 

CSS 1P Diluted 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

PASS CR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions    

* CMS-1P F  

Alternates: 

 CMS-2P    (A) $2.90   (B) $0.31  (A+B) $3.21,       

AE-P  (50/50) (A) $1.63   (B) $0.15  (A+B) $1.78  

P Squared Emulsions Plant:  Alternates: 

Tanker FOB Plant/Tanker FOB County/Drum-Tote Plant Prices 

P2 Stabilizer $2.44/$2.69/$2.64,     P2 CWE-2 $2.74/$2.99/$2.94, 

P2 CWP $2.74/$2.99/$2.94,   P2 ROC $2.57/$2.82/$2.77, 

P2 Rejuvenator $2.47/$2.72/$2.67,      P2 Prime $1.20/$1.45/$1.40 

 

 Recommend award to Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc., for the following items CMS-1P*, CHFRS-2P, CRS-2P, CRS-2, AC10-2TR, 

AC20-5TR, AC-10, AC-5, CSS-1H TACK OIL, CSS-1H TACK OIL 1:1, AC-10 XP, AC 15P, CMS-2P, AE-P 


